L%,J BUDGET TRANSFER FORM

FINANCE DEPARTMENT
MARGATE

Together We Make ¥t Great

n _DEPARTMENT INFORMATION _
| Requestor: Diane Colonna ___ Date:February 16,2017 |

Department/Division: Margate CRA
; ' BUDGET INFORMATION

__ACCOUNT NUMBER(S) | ACCOUNT NAME(S) BUDGET DECREASE | BUDGET INCREASE

| 340-0510-590-91.02 ‘Transfers/Contingency $ 15,000
| 340-0510-512-68.22 Sidewalk/Drainage/Rd Improvemn | $15,000;
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GRAND TOTAL  $15000,  $15,000
NET EFFECT OF BUDGET TRANSFER MUST = $0 $0 f

EXPLANATION
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Water Impact Fee for Melaleuca Drive Irrigation Meter. .
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Department Head or Designee:

City Manager: Date:

Finance Director or Designee: Date:
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Posted By: Date:

Group (JE)#: Reviewed By:

Revised: October 1, 2014
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Tommy Ruzzano

Board Member MARGATF

MEMO

TO: Mary Beazley
Director, Finance Department
FROM: Diane Colonna ‘ |
Executive Director, CRA -
RE: Journal Entries
DATE: February 16, 2017

Please make the necessary journal entries to compensate the City of Margate Building
Department for Water Impact Fees for the Melaleuca Drive Roadway Improvement
Project provided for the Margate CRA as follows:

Water Impact fees for meter installation

Debit $10,740 to 340-0510-512-68.22 (Sidewalk/Drainage/Road Improvement) and
credit City of Margate Building Department

Correspondence from the Building Department for the above amount is attached.
Attachments (1)
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Kim Vazquez

From: Abidemi Ajayi

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2017 12:12 PM
To: Kim Vazquez

Subject: RE: Mellaluca Dr. Irrigation Meter

Good Morning Kim,
The impact fee for a 1 inch meter is $10,740.
Please let me know if | can be of further assistance. Thanks,

Al

From: Kim Vazquez

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2017 11:46 AM
To: Abidemi Ajayi

Subject: FW: Mellaluca Dr. Irrigation Meter

Can you please provide me with the impact fee on 1” as per email below — thanks.

Kim Vazquez

Margate Community Redevelopment Agency
Project Manager

5790 Margate Boulevard

Margate, Florida 33063

(954)935-5324

Email: kvazquez@margatefl.com

Please Note: The City of Margate hours are Monday through Thursday from 8:00am — 6:00pm. Margate City Hall offices
are closed on Friday.

From: Reddy Chitepu

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2017 11:37 AM
To: Stefano.Viola@kimley-horn.com

Cc: Diane Colonna; Kim Vazquez

Subject: RE: Mellaluca Dr. Irrigation Meter

Yes, 50psi should not be a problem for that area. Our system pressure leaving the plant ranges between 62-65psi, and
the pressure drop in the system and across the pressure vacuum breaker should not be that significant. Let’s go with 1”
if it works and the additional valve. Thank you

From: Stefano.Viola@kimley-horn.com [mailto:Stefano.Viola@kimley-horn.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2017 9:47 AM

To: Reddy Chitepu

Subject: Re: Mellaluca Dr. Irrigation Meter

Reddy,



